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Abstract:

Ulaanbaatar is the capital city of Mongolia which is located at an altitude of about 1350 m 
and in a valley surrounded by the mountains. This city is known as the coldest capital city 
in the World due to its geographic features such as high altitude and landlocked location 
and prevailing wintertime Siberian high.
This work presents the concentrations of major polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbons (PAHs) 
found in  suspended particulate matter in Ulaanbaatar City. These PAH concentration 
levels were determined by  high-performance liquid chromatography (HPLC) with 
fluorescence detection. Fifteen polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbons (PAHs) were measured 
in particulate  samples collected from different sites, such as the urban center, industrial, 
ger (traditional house), residential areas in January, March, and September 2017. 
Additionally, samples were collected at the townhouse area in September. The 
concentrations of total PAH at these sites were the highest in ger area, followed in 
descending order by residential, industrial, urban center, and townhouse areas. 
Moreover, the concentrations of total PAHs were high in winter and low in summer 
(January > March > September). PAH diagnostic ratio used for identifying and assessing 
pollution emission source showed that the impact of different degree of traffic emission 
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resulted in the spatial distribution of particular PAHs. The emission of diesel based 
vehicles significantly influenced the PAH concentrations. However, a dramatic seasonal 
change in atmospheric concentrations of PAHs in Ulaanbaatar suggests that the coal 
burning systems such as coal-heating boilers is considered to be the major contributors of 
PAH. 
 


